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In the article the investment mechanisms 
of transport and logistics infrastructure and 
its regions. The problems of transport logis-
tics.

For stable operation and successfully solve 
the problem of transport services transport 
economy of the Black Sea should have mod-
ern material and technical base, advanced 
technology transportation process, convey-
ing and transportation capacity. This requires 
enhancing the investment activity, provid-
ing expanded reproduction, restoration and 
modernization of fixed assets, which directly 
depends on the financial support.

According to the general concept of 
reforming transport, it shall provide organ-
izational transformation circuit expansion 
investment financing sources related to the 
formation of the competitive environment in 
the transport market, auctioning and greater 
economic independence of market entities. 
In this connection, to strengthen strategic 
advantages in a competitive transport sec-
tor requires continuous improvement of its 
mechanism of investment and expansion of 
production and economic potential by mobi-
lizing all sources of financing.

The crisis forced a review of the role of 
government in funding a number of indus-
tries that require significant upgrading exist-
ing infrastructure and creating innovation 

to achieve growth of national economy. In 
terms of private business financial instabil-
ity (because of its unwillingness to finance 
long-term risky projects) took a wait, but the 
government afford this can not, as required 
to ensure the growth of the national economy 
in all, including crisis situation.

Fundamental sectoral features transport 
products as reproductive irreplaceable by any 
other production and inability spatial inter-
changeability of the transport of products 
(its shortage in one region can not be com-
pensated by an excess of production in the 
other), determine the need and importance of 
balanced development of financial security 
and material base vehicle both in industry 
and in the regional aspects of the structure of 
the transport sector.

In an effort to socio-economic develop-
ment of the regional economy can not be 
interested in increasing the proportion of 
transport costs in the cost of financial prod-
ucts, increasing transport ‘gross domestic 
product. The conclusion: no matter how 
large or small the total cost of living and past 
social work and work on the development of 
the transport sector, they can provide eco-
nomic benefit only indirectly, through other 
branches of material and non-material pro-
duction. Therefore, the role of transport in 
improving economic efficiency is reducing 
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in various transport ‘gross domestic product 
(specific public transport costs per unit of 
production) and the maximum reduction of 
all types of loss and damage in transporta-
tion.

The entry of Ukraine into the world com-
munity as an equal partner will contribute 
to the development of interaction between 
transport and logistics infrastructure and 
the creation of regional transport and logis-
tics systems, their further integration with 
the national and international transport and 

logistics systems cargo and goods move-
ment. This circumstance requires substantial 
revision mechanisms functioning transport 
system of Ukraine’s regions based logistics 
approach, the formation of integrated sys-
tems of organizational, economic, informa-
tion and other procedure whose purpose is 
not only to provide a better level of customer 
service, but in the globalization of economic 
activity, enhance performance international 
requirements in the field of transport and 
safekeeping of goods.


